
Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh  6624 OF

Chip Seal (Ledge Rock) Aggregate

NDOT

Opening Date: 03/16/22

Descriptio
n Qty UOM

 Unit 
Price 

 Extended 
Price  Unit Price 

 Extended 
Price 

1

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK 
D-1 
SYRACU
SE YARD 
BURR 
SPUR 70 EA  $ 53.95  $     3,776.50  $    53.65  $   3,755.50 

2

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK 
D-3 
NIOBRAR
A YARD 1400 EA  $ 29.10  $   40,740.00 0 No Bid

3

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK
D-3 WS 9 
AT JCT 
35 650 EA  $ 37.25  $   24,212.50  $    41.50  $ 26,975.00 

4

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK
D-3 NS 51 
MP 23.6 1000 EA  $ 42.50  $   42,500.00  $    41.50  $ 41,500.00 

5

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK 
D-8 
ATKINSO
N SOUTH 
YARD 2200 EA  $ 40.55  $   89,210.00 0 No Bid

6

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK 
D-8 W 
O'NEILL 
HWY 20 
MP 303 3500 EA  $ 38.30  $ 134,050.00 0 No Bid

7

CHIP 
SEAL 
LEDGE 
ROCK 
D-8 
EWING 1500 EA  $ 39.55  $   59,325.00 0 No Bid

 $ 393,814.00  $ 72,230.50 

Delivery Days ARO

COMMENTS

Li
ne

 #
Chip Seal (Ledge Rock) 

Aggregate  Spencer Quarries Inc 
 Westover Rock & Sand, 

Inc 

TOTAL

Payment Terms


